
CONTRACT #: C-1783
PROJECT #:

BID OPENING DATE: 04/04/22
PRE-BID MEETING DATE: 03/04/22

4* 6* 8* 9*

Cleaning Concierge, LLC See attached for line items R R R R Yes

Egle', LLC See attached for line items R R R R Yes

Interboro Packaging See attached for line items R R R R Yes

State Industrial Products; DBA State Chemical 
Solutions See attached for line items R R R R Yes

Westbank Janitorial & Paper Supply, LLC See attached for line items R R R R Yes

THIS PROJECT WAS POSTED ON THE MCCNO WEBSITE
THIS PROJECT WAS ADVERTISED IN THE ADVOCATE: 02/25/22 & 03/03/22

RESPONSIVE

Awarded by line item -                    
see attached "Bid Tabulation"

BID SUMMARY TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

EXHIBITS
TOTAL CONTRACT PRICECOMPANY NAME

38 items awarded

10 items awarded

77 items awarded

7 items awarded

6 items awarded

COMMENTS

 Recommendation:

EXHIBIT 4- BID FORMS (Signature, Addenda if applicable, Bid Price (Base + Alternates if applicable)
EXHIBIT 6- JOINT VENTURE
EXHIBIT 8- BID BOND
EXHIBIT 9- CORPORATE RESOLUTION  N/A - Non-Applicable 

NR = Non-Responsive
R = Responsive
Legend:
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Column1 Column2 Column3 Column4 Column42 Column5 Column6 Column8 Column10 Column12 Column14 Column142

ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE 
BID A

UNIT PRICE 
BID B

UNIT PRICE 
BID C UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE APPROVED COMMENTS

1 Small Bathroom Tissue 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $53.37 $64.79 NO

Not Approved: 
Not the same 

quantity of 
sheets per roll as 

current line 
item#1 

2 13” Black Strip Pad 175-300RPM 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $9.26 $13.80 YES

3 20” White High Lustre Polish Pad 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $17.80 $18.68 YES

4 20” Natural Fiber UHS Burnish Pad 175-600 RPM 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $17.80 $19.84 YES

5 13” Red Buffing Pad 175-600 RPM 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $9.26 $13.80 YES

6 UHS Aqua Burnish Pad 27" 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $45.26 $93.98 YES

7 Dump-Star 75# Drum w/Citron 35 gal. drum 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $612.00 $0.00 $0.00 YES

8 Proteam Genuine Intercept Micro Bags (3.25 qt/3L) 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $17.44 $0.00 N/A

9 Fragrance Pak, Morning Fresh 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $93.90 $0.00 $0.00 YES

10 D-Stroy w/Morning Fresh 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $191.50 $67.82 $0.00 NO

Not Approved: 
Inferior 

performance 
does not have 

same strenght as 
line #10 

11 Magic Mat, Urinal pads 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $38.50 $39.91 $39.42 YES

12 Ecolution Line Bac’r Drain Maintainer 5-gal pail 
D5/D19BC 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $356.40 $121.58 $0.00 YES

13 Enviro Max Vacuum Bags Premier Series 5 pk w/1 
prefilter 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

14 Roller Assembly V Soil Transfer 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC
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Column1 Column2 Column3 Column4 Column42 Column5 Column6 Column8 Column10 Column12 Column14 Column142

BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC

15 Brush, SCB, 28L, 1OSR, NYL SPL 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

16 4” Dual Edge Scraper Blade 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.99 $100.86 YES

17 20” V-Fine White Backed Diamond Pads 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

18 20” Fine White Backed Diamond Pads 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

19 Diamond 27” (Very Fine) Burnishing Pad 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

20 Sprayer Tank, 3 gallons 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $58.44 $38.94 YES

21 20” Aqua Burnish Pad 1500-3000 RPM, 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $18.06 $18.82 YES

22 Purell Advanced Hand Sanitizer 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $80.14 $74.69 N/A

23 5100N 20” Red Buffing Pad 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $17.80 $45.75 YES

24 20” Pad, White (Polish) 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $17.80 $46.25 YES

25 18” Wet Room Pad, Blue 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $130.37 $73.24 YES

26 Hand Sanitizer 3L Dispenser 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $49.50 $0.00 $0.00 YES

27 Rain Suits 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $14.72 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE

28 8” Gong Brush 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.56 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE

29 Purell Advanced Hand Sanitizer 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $100.00 $60.78 $64.36 N/A

30 Threaded Tip Wood Handles for Push Brooms 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3.45 $8.07 YES

31 60” Janitorial Length Mop Handle 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $8.69 $10.27 YES
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Column1 Column2 Column3 Column4 Column42 Column5 Column6 Column8 Column10 Column12 Column14 Column142

BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC

32 36” Push Broom (Plastic Red Bristle) 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $40.51 $0.00 YES

33 39” Lobby Brooms 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $9.48 $0.00 NO

Not Approved: 
Not 

comparable, 
broom bristles 

are on angle and 
too short, not 

sturdy

34 Utility Pad Holders 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $10.13 $0.00 YES

35 White Utility Pad 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $19.20 $0.00 YES

36 Blue Utility Pad 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $56.79 $0.00 NO

Not Approved : 
Not comparable 
to line item. Too 
soft for intended 

use

37 Brown Utility Pad 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $55.19 $0.00 YES

38 Steel Wool Soft Pads Grade 0000 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $8.96 $73.99 NO

Not Approved: 
Sample is too 

coarse and it is 
not a steel wool 
0000 grade pad. 

39 Wet Floor Signs, Bilingual - Folding Yellow 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $7.05 $11.15 YES

40 Invader 54 Wood Wet Mop 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.53 $11.98 YES

41 Jumbo Roll 2-ply Tissue 9" roll 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $38.20 $26.88 YES

42 Trash Liners 23x25  1 $12.74 $8.84 $8.84 $0.00 $0.00 $23.69 $0.00 YES

43 Trash Liners 33x40  1 $8.98 $8.14 $5.82 $0.00 $0.00 $31.19 $28.10 YES

44 Trash Liners 40x46  1 $16.24 $13.84 $12.34 $0.00 $0.00 $34.70 $34.88 YES

45 Bio Star (Green) Trash Liner (LG) 1 $67.34 $67.34 $67.34 $0.00 $0.00 $38.26 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE
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BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC

46 Bio Star (Green) Trash Liner (LG) 1 $78.34 $78.34 $78.34 $0.00 $0.00 $57.015701 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE

47 Maid Cart 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $227.64 $169.85 NO NO SAMPLE

48 Cotton Rags (white) 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $57.01 $77.25 YES

49 Clean Max Vacuum Bags 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

50 4” Light Duty Scraper 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $10.85 $31.25 N/A

51 Plastic Universal Drum Round Dolly 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $40.80 $38.75 YES

52 Brute 26/35 Quart Bucket Sidwards Pressure 
Wringer 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $52.89 $87.78 NO NO SAMPLE

53 Brute 55 Round 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $120.42 $68.71 NO

Not Approved- 
Not equivalent 
to line item unit 
(quoted unit is 

of inferior 
quality/flimsy)

54 Natural Bottles, 32 oz.  1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $65.26 $98.46 YES

55 Umbrella Bags (mini) 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $119.01 $0.00 N/A

56 Umbrella Bags (long) 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $109.60 $84.32 YES

57 Snuggle Fabric Softener Sheets 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $52.08 $65.39 YES

58 Trigger Sprayers – Red and White 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $141.30 $0.89 YES

59 24 oz. 4-ply Stay flat Cotton Mop Head Screw-on 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $32.38 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE

60 24 oz. 4-ply Stay flat Rayon Mop Head Screw-on 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $39.84 $0.00 YES

61 White 1/8-Fold Premium Essence Impressions 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $84.82 $63.18 NO
Not Approved- 
Not equivalent 
to line item unit 
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BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC

62 Maxi Pad, 250 per case 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $51.13 $61.59 YES

63 Waxed Paper Liners, 500 per case 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $24.05 $37.18 YES

64 Disposable Dust Mask 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $11.01 $14.95 YES

65 Tampons, 500 per case 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $82.73 $66.50 YES

66 Host Dry Carpet Cleaner 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

67 Filter Black Secondary for Liberator 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

68 Filter Orange Primary for Liberator 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

69 Filter 3pc Fine Particle Filter Pack 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

70 Toilet Seat Covers . 20/250 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $35.82 $61.86 YES

Not Approved: 
Cleaning 

Concierge 
Inferior quality, 

disintegrates 
when pulling 
from package

71 Safety Goggles 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.87 $0.00 YES

72 Rubber Boots 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $17.57 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE

73 Rain Suits 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $14.72 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE

74 Putty Knife 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2.15 $0.00 YES

75 Dawn Dishwashing Liquid 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $147.60 $103.44 $80.79 N/A

76 C-Fold Towels (10x13) white 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $29.39 $26.89 YES

77 Carbon Steel Blade, 10 per pack 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $9.01 $10.08 N/A
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BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC

78 Square Point Shovel 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $31.37 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE

79 Med. Black Polypropylene Floor Brush Broom 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $9.92 $16.10 YES

80 Pump Sprayer, 3 gallon 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $58.44 $38.94 YES

81 Lobby Upright Dust Pans Black 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $6.59 $9.84 YES

82 Toilet Bowl Brush (Round cylinder) 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $7.48 $3.89 N/A

83 18” Plastic Sweep Maroon Synthetic Coarse Brush 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $9.92 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE

84 Kut-A-Way 5”x48” White 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.71 $24.11 NO
Not Approved: 

Not comparable 
to line #84

85 White 1/8 Dinner Fold 8/375 (3000) 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $73.38 $69.10 N/A

86 Oil Absorbent, 50 Lb. Bag 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $10.09 $13.78 N/A

87 Pledge Lemon Furniture Wipes 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $76.05 N/A

88 Microfiber Aluminum Frames 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $137.74 $111.78 YES

89 Microfiber Telescopic Handles 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $109.41 $114.84 YES

90 Canvas Top Rubber Palm Gloves XL $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.40 $0.00 YES

91 Degreasalator, 4 gal. per case 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $48.89 $0.00 NO
Not Approved: 

Not comparable 
to line #84

92 Treadsafe Concentrate 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

93 Tyvek Dupont Coveralls XXL w/hood 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $29.33 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE
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BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC

94 Tyvek Dupont Coveralls XXXL w/hood 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $189.95 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE

95 Opti-Loc Tele-Poles Extension 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $45.12 $55.78 N/A

96 Trash Picker/Grabber 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $28.03 $35.39 YES

97 Star Duster Pipe Brush 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $19.02 $26.19 N/A

98 Soft Replacement Squeegee Rubber 12" 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $81.98 $11.25 N/A

99 Soft Replacement Squeegee Rubber 18" 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $91.31 $13.78 N/A

100 Tele-Plus Poles Modular System 3 Section 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $64.98 $0.00 YES

101 Original Strip Washers w/Handle 12" 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $19.69 $23.31 YES

102 Original Strip Washers w/Handle 18" 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $22.51 $31.21 YES

103 Cotton Mop Head (24 ply screw on bolt head) 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $32.38 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE

104 White Rayon Mops 24 oz. 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $39.84 $0.00 YES

105 Micro spin NB Mop (Medium) Green/White 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

106 Bowl Mop (Soft) 4 ½ White Acid Resistant - 
Propylene 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.20 $1.44 N/A

107 Grout Brush 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $8.06 $2.10 N/A

108 Goodwrappers Shrinkwrap 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

109 Windsor Sensor Vac Plus Bags 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $25.01 $0.00 N/A

110 Igloo Cooler (5 gal.) Red 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID
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BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC

111 Buckeye Penetrate Floor Stripper 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $54.40 $106.15 $0.00 NO

Not Approved: 
Performance is 

average, 
chemical odor is 

too strong

112 Floor Scrub Brushes 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.35 $24.69 NO NO SAMPLE

113 13” Counter Bench Brush Poly- Plastic Blue 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

114 39” Polyester Replacement Wall Brush - Red 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

115 Acme Thread Connection Broom Wood Handle  - 
Metal Tip 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3.48 $0.00 YES

116 60” Janitorial Screw-On Wood Handle to be used 
with cotton mop head 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $62.06 $100.80 YES

117 Wood Mop Handle 60” 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $6.04 $12.44 NO

Not Approved: 
Not 

comparable, too 
flimsy 

118 Tough Guy Swivel Holders 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $10.13 $9.31 YES

119 Toilet Bowl Brush (Poly) 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.20 $5.97 YES

120 Scraper 4” Flexible Wall Scraper 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $12.70 $0.00 YES

121 Side Gate Cotton String Wet Mop Head 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $7.53 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE

122 Screw-on Cotton String Wet Mop Head 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $32.38 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE

123 Toilet Bowl Brush , 12 per case 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $14.96 $71.64 YES

124 Floor Maintenance Pad, Black, Super Strip 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $24.19 $0.00 YES

125 Dual Surface Floor 10” Deck Scrub Brush, Blue 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.35 $0.00 YES

126 18” Ergo Tech Soft Rubber 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID
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BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC

127 Star Duster Wall Brush 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $25.15 $32.08 N/A

128 Industrial Duster – Lambswool 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $7.90 $18.63 YES

129 Utility Knife 6 3/8” Carbon 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $45.42 $56.80 N/A

130 Tele-Plus Poles Modular System 2 Section 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

131 Tele-Plus Poles Modular System 4 section 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

132 20” Black Strip Pad 175-300 RPM 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $17.86 $18.68 YES

133 880-B White Preserve Hardwound Towel 7.9 x 800 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $29.61 $34.58 NO

No Approved: 
Not 

comparable, 
color is not the 

same. 

134 Formula 190X 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $269.60 $0.00 $0.00 YES

135 Genuine Filter Bag, 10 per pack 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

136 String Knit PVC Dot Gloves - XL 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

137 String Knit PVC Dot Gloves - L 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $30.24 $0.00 YES

138 Waste Basket (BLK), 16 per case 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $113.33 $95.82 N/A

139 Jumbo Bathroom Tissue, 2-ply 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $38.20 $26.88 NO
NoT Approved- 
Not equivalent 
to current item 

140 Verde Floor Finish 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $108.45 $0.00 NO

Not Approved- 
Nor equivalent 
in performance 
to Verde Floor 
Finish, odor is 

strong

141 Tyvek Coverall XXL with hood and boot 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $258.00 $0.00 N/A
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Column1 Column2 Column3 Column4 Column42 Column5 Column6 Column8 Column10 Column12 Column14 Column142

BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC

142 Tyvek Coverall XL with hood and boot 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $246.00 $0.00 N/A

143 Tyvek Coverall L with hood and boot 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $244.50 $0.00 N/A

144 Spandex Covers for 55 gal. 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

145 Powder Free Vinyl Gloves M (non-medical) 1 $39.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $96.71 $82.57 YES

146 Powder Free Vinyl Gloves XL (non-medical) 1 $39.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $96.71 $85.57 YES

147 Foam Alcohol Hand Sanitizer 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $87.79 NO

No Approved- 
Not equivalent 

to current 
item/Unit 

Quoted is soap

148 Toilet Brush (15 ½ Plastic Handle) 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $46.35 $52.02 YES

149 ECO Neutral Disinfectant 1 $39.48 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $58.275 $127.54 $0.00 NO Not Approved 
(No sample)

150 RMC Enviro Care Tough Job 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $181.50 $46.89 $0.00 YES

151 ECO Hydrogen Peroxide 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $66.33 $0.00 NO

Not Approved: 
This is a ready 
to use product, 

not a 
concentrate to 

be used in 
dilution system 

currently 
instaled/ not 
comparable

152 ECO Glass Cleaner (HD E12/S12) 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $35.10 $56.95 $0.00 NO

Not Approved- 
Not comparable 

to line #152 
product 

performance is 
inferior
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Column1 Column2 Column3 Column4 Column42 Column5 Column6 Column8 Column10 Column12 Column14 Column142

BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC

153 RMC Air Fresh Aire Odor Control 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $133.48 $240.00 $31.30 $0.00 YES

Not Approved: 
Cleaning 
Concierge 
Product not 
comparable, 
inferior 
performance 

154 ECO Hydrogen Peroxide Spray Bottle 32 oz. plastic 
clear 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

155 RMC Perfecto 7 Lavender Neutral Cleaner 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $50.99 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 YES

156 RMC Enviro Care Lotion Handsoap (Blue) 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $48.71 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 YES

157 Spray bottles, 32 oz 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $65.26 $0.00 YES

158 Trigger Sprayers 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $141.30 $98.46 YES

159 ASTM 6400 Envision Composting Liners (40x46) 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $57.01 $83.40 NO No sample

160 STOUT Eco Safe 6400 (42x48) Compostable bag 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $97.94 $0.00 NO

Not Approved: 
Milimeter is less 

than what is 
required 

161 Liquid Concentrate Detergent 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $953.00 $1,147.71 $0.00 YES

162 ECOS Pro Metal Cleaner and Polish Unscented 
Fragrance 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

163 ECOS Pro Metal Cleaner and Polish 32 oz Trigger 
Sprayer Bottle 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

164 Diamond 27” (Very, Very Fine) Burnishing Pad 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

165 Kut-A-Way 5”x48” White 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.71 $24.11 NO NO SAMPLE

166 Toilet Bowl Brush 15 ½ WHT. 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $7.48 $3.89 N/A

167 Blue Recycling Trash Liner 12-16 gal. 1 $38.82 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 YES

Page 12 of 16



Column1 Column2 Column3 Column4 Column42 Column5 Column6 Column8 Column10 Column12 Column14 Column142

BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC

168 Blue Recycling Trash Liner – 33 gal. 1 $39.82 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/A

149 Blue Recycling Trash Liner – 55 gal. 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

170 430 Husky Crème Cleanser 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $178.40 $40.31 $48.09 NO

Not Approved: 
Inferior 

performance, 
weaker formula 

compared to line 
#170

171 Tyvek Coveralls L w/hood 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $202.62 $0.00 N/A

172 Filter 3 pc Fine Particle Filter Pack 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

173 Filter Black Secondary 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

174 Filter Orange Primary 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

175 Host Dry Carpet Cleaner 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

176 Spandex Covers 25 gal. 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

177 24 oz 4-ply Stayflat Rayon Mop Head 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $39.84 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE

178 Tele-Plus Poles Modular System 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

179 880-B White Preserve Hardwound Towel 7.9x800 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $34.99 $34.58 NO
No Approved- 
Not equivalent 
to current item 

180 Toilet Bowl Mop w/handle 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.08 YES

181 Professional Choice Lemon 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $193.40 $51.45 $56.92 YES

182 Big Foot Industrial Door Stoppers, Brown 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $323.92 $172.50 YES

183 27” Very Fine 3000 GRIT 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID
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Column1 Column2 Column3 Column4 Column42 Column5 Column6 Column8 Column10 Column12 Column14 Column142

BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC

184 Safety Vest (Highlight Color) Size L/XL 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.45 $0.00 YES

185 Brute Recycling Container Lid 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $186.86 $41.08 N/A

186 Office Recycling Container, Blue 10 gal 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $14.40 $0.00 YES

187 Office Recycling Container, Blue 7 gal. 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $7.09 $0.00 YES

188 Smart Color MicroWipes 4000 Red 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.22 $0.00 YES

189 Smart Color MicroWipes 4000 Orange 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.18 $0.00 YES

190 Smart Color MicroWipes4000 Yellow 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.75 $0.00 YES

191 Smart Color MicroWipes 4000 Green 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.75 $0.00 YES

192 Smart Color MicroWipes 4000 Blue 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.75 $0.00 YES

193 Eco Glass Cleaner E12 Spray Bottle 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $113.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO

Not Approved- 
Not equal to line 

item#193/ 
Product is ready 

to use

194 Eco Neutral Disinfectant 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $72.45 $0.00 $0.00 NO
Not Approved- 

Not equal to line 
item #194

195 Spray bottles w/ triggers 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $22.50 $0.00 $26.63 NO

Not Approved- 
Bottle would be 
used for specific 
chemical from 
State Industrial 

only 

196 Spray bottles, 32 oz, 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $47.26 YES

197 ASTM 6400-Envision Composting Bag 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $97.94 $0.00 NO NO SAMPLE

198 Purell Advanced Hand Sanitizer 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $100.00 $60.78 $77.70 N/A
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Column1 Column2 Column3 Column4 Column42 Column5 Column6 Column8 Column10 Column12 Column14 Column142

BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC

199 C-Fold Towels (10x13) white 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $29.39 $26.89 NO
No Approved- 
Not equivalent 
to current item 

200 Star Duster Pipe Brush 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $26.19 YES

201 Original Strip Washers 10” w/handle 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

202 Star Duster Wall Brush, 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $125.77 $32.08 N/A

203 Enviro Care Tough Job 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $104.90 $151.10 $42.23 $0.00 YES

Not Approved: 
Cleaning 
Concierge 

Product is not 
comparable, 

inferior 
performance

204 RMC Enviro Care Carpet & Upholstery Cleaner 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $115.26 $110.60 $71.82 $0.00 YES

Not Approved: 
Cleaning 

Concierge / 
State Industrial 
Not comparable 

to line item, 
odor is scent is 

too strong

205 DFE VMR Graffiti Removal 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $170.16 $0.00 $12.40 $0.00 YES

Not Approved: 
Cleaning 
Concierge 

chemical odor is 
strong, chemical 
is highly irritant 

(skin and 
inhlation)

206 Dump Star 75# Drum 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $612.00 $0.00 $0.00 YES

207 Fragrance Pak, Morning Fresh 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $7.825 $0.00 $0.00 YES

208 Magic Mat, Pure Metal 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $38.50 $0.00 $0.00 YES

209 Grease-B-Gone 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $252.00 $95.50 $0.00 YES
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Column1 Column2 Column3 Column4 Column42 Column5 Column6 Column8 Column10 Column12 Column14 Column142

BID TABULATION SHEET FOR
C-1783 Procurement of Janitorial Supplies

Substitution

Items in RED are substitutions

Interboro Packaging Egle', LLC
State Industrial 
Products; DBA 
State Chemical 

Solutions

Cleaning 
Concierge, 

LLC

Westbank 
Janitorial & 

Paper Supply, 
LLC

210 Formula 190X 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $269.60 $0.00 $0.00 YES

211 27” Fine 1500 GRIT 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

212 Blue Recycling Trash Liner 33 gal. 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

213 Blue Recycling Trash Liner 55 gal. 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

214 20” Diamond Maintenance Floor Pad 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

215 20” Diamond Maintenance Floor Pad V-Fine 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID

216 Clean Max Pro Series Vacuum 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $511.42 $0.00 NO

Not Approved- 
Unit Quoted is 
not equivalent/ 
Unit not listed 

in CRI as 
certified 
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